
201 1024 Fairfield Rd, Victoria
$529,000

Come and experience the lifestyle that Fairfield 
West has to offer. A beautiful stroll down tree-
lined streets leads you in one direction to the 
vibrant Cook St Village and the other to the heart 
of the city. This 2 bedroom 2 bathroom corner unit 
spans over 1,000 sqft and the spacious living/
dining room is filled with natural light. The kitchen 
offers updated stone countertops and opens up 
onto the dedicated dining area. Enjoy watching the 
world wake up with your coffee from your 
enclosed patio, or enjoy meals on your balcony 
regardless of the weather. The spacious primary 
suite offers a walkthrough closet to a two-piece 
bathroom. The Westfield is a professionally 
managed & proactive strata. The building has been 
renewed with modern balonies, window and patio 
doors. The strata welcomes families, rentals & two 
cats! Do all your laundry at once in the shared 
common laundry room. Leave your car behind in 
the secure underground parkade and enjoy all that 
this unbeatable location has to offer by foot. 
(id:56120)

KEY INFORMATION

MLS® 955521

Residential Attached

Fairfield West

2 Bedrooms

2 Bathrooms

1,008 SF

1,108 SF Lot

FEATURES

Year Built: 1976

Listed By: Royal LePage Coast Capital - Oak Bay
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