
606 South Crest Drive, Kelowna
$969,900

UNDER $1,000,000 | Welcome to 606 South 
Crest Drive, nestled in Kelowna’s spectacular 
UPPER MISSION. This recently updated home 
sits on a private 5,070 SqFt lot. Featuring: 4 bed | 
4 bath over 2,478 SqFt of living space over three 
levels. Potential for SUITE: Basement offers a 
large family room, office, gym, or 4th bedroom 
which could easily be closed off. Need to add 
exterior stairs and a side door for access. $25,000 
spent on updated interior details include: new 
paint, baseboards, trim, carpet, levelling and new 
sod in backyard. Main floor opens up seamlessly to 
the rest of the home, great for entertaining inside 
and out. Immerse yourself into the OKANAGAN 
LIFE w/ sun drenched backyard + peek-a-boo 
LAKE VIEW. Close to Wineries, beaches, and 
regional parks. SCHOOLS: Anne McClymont 
Elementary, Canyon Falls Middle School, and 
OKM High School catchment. SHOPPING: 
Mission Village is now open, Save-On-Foods, 
Shoppers, Dollarama, Dentist, Liquor Store and 
more to come. THIS MUST BE THE PLACE. 
(id:56120)

KEY INFORMATION

MLS® 10319030

Residential Detached

Southwest Mission

4 Bedrooms

4 Bathrooms

2,478 SF

5,227 SF Lot

FEATURES

Year Built: 2003

Listed By: rennie & associates realty ltd.

Celeste Ziegler
604.861.6672
cziegler@rennie.com
rennie.com/celesteziegler

Rob Breckwoldt PREC*
604.459.7778
rbreckwoldt@rennie.com
rennie.com/robbreckwoldt

* PERSONAL REAL ESTATE CORPORATION. THIS COMMUNICATION IS NOT INTENDED TO CAUSE OR INDUCE A BREACH OF AN EXISTING AGREEMENT(S). E.& O.E
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