
1078 Brookview Dr, Metchosin
$1,790,000

Welcome to 1078 Brookview Drive! This family 
home is nestled in a quiet and serene setting and 
it’s very rare for a property this unique and 
beautiful to hit the market. It offers a perfect blend 
of comfort and nature amongst hundreds fur, 
cedar and arbutus trees, amongst others. You have 
your own bridge crossing a lovely fish-bearing 
creek surrounded by sandy beaches on both sides! 
Local birds and other wildlife love the property 
too. Located in lovely Metchosin, tranquility best 
describes the 2.73 acres surrounded by forest, 
hillside and your own private trails. This west 
coast vibe features wood details throughout and 
one of the Island's largest fireplaces enjoyed by the 
entire main level, along with many windows 
offering views reminiscent of a large treehouse. 
You'll enjoy entertaining in your large updated 
kitchen with adjoining formal dining and living 
areas, and a huge wrap-around deck off the kitchen 
to accommodate larger groups. Upstairs offers a 
large primary bedroom with a walk-in closet and 
deck, two additional bedrooms, a laundry room, 
and an open office. There's also a three bedroom 
accommodation on the lower floor which can be 
adjoined by stairs to the upper levels for a larger 
family, or blocked off and utilized as an excellent 
mortgage helper. This home includes a brand new 
addition, electrical upgrades for electric vehicles, 
and a new modern septic system which is due to 
last the next forty years and multiple generations 
of your family. Heading back outside, you can 
enjoy your Japanese tea room or soak in your own 
wood fired cedar hot tub alongside the creek. The 
list goes on! Call your agent ! (id:56120)

KEY INFORMATION

MLS® 968817

Residential Detached

Metchosin

5 Bedrooms

4 Bathrooms

FEATURES
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