
3521 Waters Edge Dr, Sooke
$1,949,900

A waterfront property that is absolutely stunning 
in every way! 2018 built, classic true west coast 
post-and-beam nearly 3000 sqft (1175 sq ft 
unfinished in the basement ready for a suite or 
additional living space). Full time residence, 
vacation property, or run it as a vacation rental 
(still OK in this area!) From the moment you enter, 
you’ll know you’re in a special place: fir floors 
throughout, high ceilings, huge windows to take in 
the views of the strait of Juan de Fuca and Olympic 
Mountains. Details like huge natural beams and a 
custom-hewn staircase to the upper level primary 
bedroom and luxurious ensuite continue to tell the 
story of this beautiful home. A perfect sitting area 
or home office on the landing to take in the view. A 
kitchen with stone counters and stainless 
appliances, and a feature stone wall in the living 
room with wood-burning insert. Another huge 
bedroom with deck access, and a main bath with 
walk-in rain shower. Outside, enjoy the huge patio, 
fenced yard, and custom stairs down the bluff to 
the waterfront. Winter storms? No problem - 
backup generator runs the essentials and water 
system. (id:56120)

KEY INFORMATION

MLS® 975341

Residential Detached

Jordan River

2 Bedrooms

2 Bathrooms

2,929 SF

125,888 SF Lot

FEATURES

Year Built: 2018

Listed By: Royal LePage Coast Capital - Sooke
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