
555 Leaside Ave, Saanich
$2,699,999

his beautiful custom home in the West Saanich 
Glanford area combines modern luxury with ample 
space, nestled on a large 80x120 lot with abundant 
parking and a two-car garage. With over 4,000 
square feet of living space, this property features 9 
bedrooms, 5 kitchens, and 6 bathrooms, making it 
ideal for extended families or as a lucrative rental 
investment. The interior is styled with lovely 
modern colours and granite countertops 
throughout, exuding elegance. The home offers 2 
crawl spaces for extra storage and ease of 
plumbing access. The property is professionally 
landscaped with palms, creating a serene and 
tropical ambiance. The lush exterior is not only 
visually stunning but also equipped with a 
sprinkler system to ensure the grounds stay 
pristine and vibrant year-round with minimal 
effort. Situated in a prime location near Royal Oak 
Shopping Centre, this home is a perfect blend of 
style and practicality. (id:56120)

KEY INFORMATION

MLS® 976883

Residential Detached

Glanford

9 Bedrooms

6 Bathrooms

4,441 SF

9,600 SF Lot

FEATURES

Year Built: 2009

Listed By: eXp Realty
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